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13" November 2025
Dear

FOI Request

Thank you for your Freedom of Information dated 13" November. In your request you
asked for the following information.

1. Why did the Crown Prosecution Service, Police & Courts never disclose any of the
collapsed cases to me before | went to court in early 1998

2. Why have the Crown Prosecution Service, Police & Courts, other than sending me a
"Tulisa Disclosure pack" at end of 2014 never as yet disclosed to me any of the other
collapsed cases mentioned below?

3. Are there any other cases at any time that the HM Crown Prosecution Service
Inspectorate, is aware of that have collapsed due to Mazher Mahmood's proven lies and
unreliability as a witness of truth?

If relevant reports exist but are partially exempt, | request disclosure of redacted versions
rather than a refusalin full.

| can confirm that HMCPSI does not hold information in the scope of this request.
HMCPSI are not in a position to answer questions 1 and 2 and we do not hold any
information in relation to question 3.

If you are dissatisfied with any aspect of our response to your request, please send full
details within two calendar months of the date of this email and send to the below email
address: info@HMCPSI.gov.uk

You also have the right to ask the Information Commissioner to investigate any aspect of
your complaint. Please note that the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICQO) is likely to
expect the internal complaints procedures to have been exhausted before beginning an
investigation.

Yours sincerely

HM Crown Prosecution Inspectorate
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